
Line Description Style# UOM Qty.

F&F and A. 

Jacobs & 

Sons, Inc.

Atlantic 

Tactical

Municipal 

Emergency 

Services

MD Fire 

Equipment 

Corporation

Arrow 

Safety 

Device

Graves 

Uniforms

MD 

Police 

Supply

Lawmen's
Chief 

Supply

1 Shirt, Elbeco, long-sleeve, white 3110/9310 Ea. 50 28.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Shirt, Elbeco, short-sleeve, white 3310/9810 Ea. 50 25.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3  L/Sleeve Navy Mock Turtleneck  - Blauer 8110X Ea. 100 19.75 No Bid 19.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Shirt, Elbeco, long-sleeve, lt. blue (Paragon Plus)     P878-3 Ea. 40 26.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Jacket, Olympic – Bike  OVP587 See spec Ea. 40 283.65 277.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Jacket, 5.11 – Bike 45801 See spec Ea. 40 139.45 No Bid
106.00 & 

110.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Jacket, Blauer – Bike 4670 See spec Ea. 40 131.45 No Bid 94.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Shirt, Bike (Black/Royal Blue) - Olympic See Spec Ea. 80 90.75 96.70
31.00 & 

33.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 Shirt, 5.11 – Bike 71322 See spec Ea. 80 49.75 No Bid 44.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Shirt, Blauer – Bike 8133 See Spec Ea. 80 64.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 Shirt, Elbeco, short-sleeve, lt. blue (Paragon Plus)      P868-3 Ea. 40 20.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 Shirt, Blauer, Long Sleeve Navy - Classact 8431 Ea. 200 32.75 No Bid 32.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 Shirt, Blauer, Short Sleeve Navy 8421 Ea. 200 28.60 No Bid 27.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 Shirt, Port Authority polo for civilians Ea. 60 11.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 Pants, Blauer Street Wear with side pockets 8810X Ea. 200 50.25 No Bid 50.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 Pants, Blauer Street Wear w/outside pockets 8821 Ea. 60 46.40 No Bid 50.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 Shorts, 8” Phoenix cycling (Olympic) with pad OPS168 Ea. 120 57.75 54.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 Shorts, 5.11, Patrol Short 43057 Ea. 120 40.70 No Bid 39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 Shorts, Blauer, Flextech 8842 Ea. 120 50.00 No Bid 52.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Jacket, Blauer Tacshell (9820) w/ Soft-shell fleece liner/jacket (4660) – Dark Navy 9820 4660 Ea. 40 256.75 No Bid 256.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 Cycling Pants, Supplex  Approach  (Mocean) – Black w/pad 2150 Ea. 100 73.50 69.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 Cycling Pants, 5.11, Bike Patrol Pant 45502 Ea. 100 61.10 No Bid 61.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 Cycling Pants, Blauer, Flextech 8822 Ea. 100 59.70 No Bid 64.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 Sweater, Blauer Navy 210/v-neck Ea. 30 74.05 No Bid 63.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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25 Sweater, Blauer Navy 225/v-neck Ea. 30 79.80 No Bid 69.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 Sweater, women’s Navy – Blauer – zipper front 227 Ea. 10 91.20 No Bid 72.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 Raincoat, Rainfair, yellow 2100-8000 Ea. 80 17.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 Raincoat, Flying Cross, Reversible Black/HV yellow 76120 Ea. 60 150.00 142.25 No Bid 169.00 No Bid 179.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 White dress/honor guard gloves Ea. 25 2.95 1.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00 No Bid No Bid

30 Tie, clip-on, regular, black Ea. 30 2.95 2.90 No Bid 4.00 No Bid 4.75 5.00 No Bid 4.45

31 Tie, clip-on, extra-long, black Ea. 20 3.00 2.90 No Bid 4.00 No Bid 4.75 6.00 No Bid 5.15

32 Hat, Bayly, solid, winter See spec Ea. 50 36.00 52.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 Hat, Bayly, mesh, summer See spec Ea. 100 36.00 53.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 Hat, rain cover w/ visor, vinyl (price per dozen) Dz. 5 34.00 43.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.00 No Bid No Bid

35 Hat, Bayly Mesh Cover Ea. 100 18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 Belt, Garrison, silver buckle B52 Ea. 10 13.00 14.75 30.10 13.00 No Bid No Bid 26.00 No Bid 27.50

37 Belt, Bianchi nylon Sam Brown 7200 Ea. 40 No Bid 33.40 No Bid No Bid 36.67 44.25 55.50 No Bid 36.65

38 Belt, Bianchi nylon underbelt 7205 Ea. 30 21.60 20.50 No Bid No Bid 20.33 24.75 31.00 No Bid 20.50

39 Belt, Garrison, Gold Buckle B52 Ea. 6 13.50 14.75 30.10 13.00 No Bid No Bid 26.00 No Bid 28.50

40 Belt keeper, Bianchi nylon (price per 4-pack) 6406 4-Pk. 200 10.50 7.75 No Bid No Bid 9.17 11.92 9.00 No Bid 9.25

41 Town of Ocean City collar pins w/ Police rocker Ea. 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.50 25.00 No Bid No Bid

42 Stripes, SGT, blue/black (price per pair) Pr. 100 1.60 1.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.96 3.00 No Bid No Bid

43 Stripes, Cpl, blue/black (price per pair) Pr. 100 1.60 1.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.96 3.00 No Bid No Bid

44 Stripes, PFC, blue/black (price per pair) Pr. 100 1.60 1.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.96 3.00 No Bid No Bid

45 Collar Pins, Gold Captain (price per pair) Pr. 5 9.90 4.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00 7.00 No Bid No Bid

46 Collar Pins, Gold Lieutenant (price per pair) Pr. 20 9.90 4.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00 7.00 No Bid No Bid

47 Chevrons, collar, SGT, Premier (price per pair) P205 Pr. 24 11.45 4.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.25 6.00 No Bid No Bid

48 Chevrons, collar, Cpl,  Premier (price per pair) P203 Pr. 30 11.45 4.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.25 6.00 No Bid No Bid

49 Chevrons, collar, PFC, Premier (price per pair) P200 Pr. 30 11.45 4.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.25 6.00 No Bid No Bid

50 Name tag, Blackington, silver A7159 Ea. 200 11.90 12.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00 11.00 13.49 No Bid

51 Shirt Stays – Black with Stirrup (price per pair) Pr. 100 8.95 7.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.25 6.00 No Bid No Bid
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52 Name tag, Blackington, gold A7159 Ea. 10 11.90 12.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00 12.50 13.49 No Bid

53 Pins, commendation, Blackington w and w/o #’s A3705 Ea. 100 10.50 9.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00
13.23/10.9

5
No Bid

54 Pins, commendation, Blackington w and w/o #’s A3704 Ea. 100 10.50 9.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00
13.23/10.9

5
No Bid

55 Pins, silver star, Blackington A6267 Ea. 20 12.40 12.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00
13.12/10.9

5
No Bid

56 Pins, Assorted, Blackington  w and w/o #s Ea. 120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00
13.12/10.9

5
No Bid

57 MSI Oleoresin Capsicum Spray MK-9 Magnum 5.5% Ea. 12 No Bid 38.60 34.50 No Bid 35.31 No Bid 50.00 No Bid No Bid

58 OC Spray Case for MK-9 aerosol, nylon Ea. 12 No Bid 17.40 23.00 No Bid 26.67 No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid

59 Sabre Red Crossfire MK-3, 5.5% Ea. 300 No Bid 10.40 8.50 No Bid 12.03 No Bid 9.00 No Bid No Bid

60 OC Spray case for MK-3 aerosol, black leather Ea. 100 No Bid 19.65 21.76 No Bid 22.17 No Bid 18.00 No Bid No Bid

61 Handcuffs, Smith & Wesson, nickel 100 Ea. 25 22.50 20.97 23.50 No Bid 23.33 28.95 24.00 23.79 23.35

62 Handcuff Case, Bianchi Nylon 7300-S Ea. 20 17.20 16.45 No Bid No Bid 16.17 No Bid 25.00 No Bid 16.25

63 Handcuff Keys – Oversized –3 inch length H.W.C. Ea. 100 5.50 3.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.50 6.50 5.75 No Bid

64 Magazine  Pouch Double, Bianchi Nylon 7302HS Ea. 20 No Bid 21.60 No Bid No Bid 23.84 No Bid 36.00 No Bid 23.85

65 Gloves – HATCH Winter Specialist NS430L Ea. 50 18.75 18.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.00 No Bid 16.75

66 Ansi 207-2006 Traffic Vest/Police & Ocean City Logo                              See Specs Ea. 50 41.50 56.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

67 5.11 ATAC TMT R1 Flashlight w/ charger Ea. 30 91.60 No Bid 90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

68 Blackhawk CF Flashlight holder w/ Mo-U-Lok attachment Ea. 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00 13.50 No Bid

69 Monadnock Detective 26 Baton – Friction Expandable Ea. 75 79.35 64.65 No Bid No Bid 68.00 No Bid 95.00 No Bid No Bid

70 Battery, Stinger XT – Replacement Ea. 30 15.25 14.75 12.50 17.00 No Bid No Bid 17.50 No Bid 5.50

71 Battery, SL-20 XP Replacement Ea. 30 23.80 19.90 No Bid 35.00 No Bid No Bid 31.00 No Bid 9.50

72 Bulbs, 5.11 TMT R1 Replacement Ea. 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73 Bulbs, Flashlight Replacement  Stinger DS Ea. 20 8.35 6.80 20.34 19.00 No Bid No Bid 9.00 No Bid No Bid

74 Bulbs, Flashlight Replacement SL-20 XP Ea. 20 No Bid 12.90 10.94 12.00 No Bid No Bid 15.00 No Bid No Bid

75 Streamlight  SL-20XP LED Orange Flashlight Ea. 10 No Bid 88.35 86.34 72.00 No Bid No Bid 120.00 No Bid No Bid

76 CPR Masks – MDI Complete Kit 70-185 Ea. 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.96 No Bid 17.50 No Bid No Bid

77 CPR Masks – MDI Refill Kits 70-186 Ea. 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.51 No Bid 9.00 No Bid No Bid
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78 Blauer Stretch Adjustable Cap  Black 182-1 Ea. 200 8.75 No Bid 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

79 Blauer Stretch Fitted Cap Black 182 Ea. 200 8.75 No Bid 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 Blauer Skull Cap  Navy 160 Ea. 200 15.10 No Bid 14.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid


